
344-24
2024 SAND, LOAM, CLAY, STONE, GRAVEL, ROADMIX 
Bid Tabulation
October 4, 2023

DELIVERED PRICE Grillo Services Valley Sand & Gravel Mallico Carriere Materials Tilcon Connecticut
--------------------------------- ----------- ------------------------------- --------------------------------- ---------------------- ------------------------------- -------------------------------
Sand cuyd 59.00 35.00 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Loam cuyd 45.00 35.00 25.50 No Bid No Bid
Clay, ballfield cuyd 75.00 65.00 68.50 105.00 No Bid
Stone, 1/2" ton 63.00 35.00 28.10 No Bid 32.70
Stone, 3/4" ton 63.00 35.00 30.10 No Bid 30.40
Stone, 1-1/4" ton 63.00 35.00 26.10 No Bid 29.55
Gravel, washed, 1/2" ton 88.00 48.00 28.10 No Bid No Bid
Gravel, washed, 3/4" ton 88.00 48.00 28.35 No Bid No Bid
Roadmix, 3/4" ton 60.00 25.00 21.35 No Bid No Bid

PICKED UP PRICE Grillo Services Valley Sand & Gravel Mallico O & G Industries Tilcon Connecticut
--------------------------------- ----------- ------------------------------- --------------------------------- ---------------------- ------------------------------- -------------------------------
Sand cuyd 56.00 No Bid 27.50 No Bid No Bid
Loam cuyd 42.00 No Bid 25.50 No Bid No Bid
Clay, ballfield cuyd 80.00 No Bid 68.50 No Bid No Bid
Stone, 1/2" ton 59.00 No Bid 28.10 No Bid 23.75
Stone, 3/4" ton 59.00 No Bid 30.10 No Bid 21.45
Stone, 1-1/4" ton 59.00 No Bid 26.10 No Bid 20.60
Gravel, washed, 1/2" ton 85.00 No Bid 28.10 No Bid No Bid
Gravel, washed, 3/4" ton 85.00 No Bid 28.35 No Bid No Bid
Roadmix, 3/4" ton 57.00 No Bid 21.35 No Bid No Bid

Company                                  Telephone
Grillo Services                         203-877-5070 
Valley Sand & Gravel             203-467-6328
Mallico Construction             203-799-2294
Carriere Materials                 914-469-9092
Tilcon                                        860-357-1635
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